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NAME OF THE PRODUCT

PERFECT HYDRA FOUNDATION -
Neutral

CODE

LM16

FORMAT

30 mL
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DESCRIPTION

Perfect Hydra Foundation is a liquid foundation with a light texture and velvety finish, designed to perfect
the complexion by evening out the skin tone and optically correcting any skin discromia. Characterised by
a paraben-free, vegan and cruelty-free formula, comfortable and easy to apply, it is enriched with a series
of active ingredients with a moisturising, protective and anti-ageing action: - Green tea: helps fighting free
radicals and counteracting the effects of stress and premature cellular ageing. - Active that restores the
ideal level of Hyaluronic Acid, stimulating its synthesis: moisturises the skin both in depth and on the
surface, making it more elastic, plumped up and smoother. - Poppy Seed Oil: a natural emollient that
performs a softening and conditioning action, capable of smoothing and restoring the skin's natural barrier.

HOW TO USE

Apply a small amount of product with a foundation brush or sponge. Make circular movements to blend the
product, working from the centre towards the outside of face and neck.

WARNING

If in eyes, rinse thoroughly and get medical attention, if necessary. Avoid release to the environment. Avoid
any accidental damage or incorrect handling that might cause product leakage. Store in a cool, dry place
away from heat.

INGREDIENTS (INCI)

Aqua, cyclopentasiloxane, ethylhexyl methoxycinnamate, titanium dioxide, propylene glycol, hydrolyzed
yeast extract, potassium cetyl phosphate, squalane, beheneth-30, myristyl alcohol, zinc stearate, glycerin,
glyceryl isostearate, glyceryl stearate, caprylyl glycol, bis-peg-18 methyl ether dimethyl silane, c10-18
triglycerides, silica, polyacrylamide, phenoxyethanol, carbomer, sodium hydroxide, c13-14 isoparaffin,
papaver somniferum seed oil, helianthus annuus seed oil, parfum, hexylene glycol, cetearyl alcohol,
cetearyl glucoside, mica, laureth-7, cetyl hydroxyethylcellulose, camelia sinensis leaf extract, benzyl
salicylate, polyglucuronic acid, sodium stearate, alpha isomethyl ionone, cellulose gum, pentaerythrityl
tetra-di-t-butyl hydroxyhydrocinnamate, xanthan gum, linalool, lecithin, eugenol, hydroxycitronellal, amyl
cinnamal, isoeugenol, limonene, citronellol, geraniol, benzyl alcohol. MAY CONTAIN +/-: CI 77891, CI
77007, CI 77491, CI 77492, CI 77499, CI 77288, CI 42090.

PAO DEADLINE

12 Months
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